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Samsung Galaxy Note8 bags DisplayMate's highest ever A+ grade ... the Galaxy Note8 display has surpassed the one on the
Galaxy S8 in its testing. ... The Infinity Display of the Galaxy Note8 boasts a record high peak .... The Galaxy S8 earned top
marks thanks to the record-setting specs of its curved, full-screen OLED display, which nearly fills the entire front face of the
smartphone from edge to edge. ... Video content is even more vivid and engaging thanks to the Galaxy S8’s new, high-saturation
.... Design wise, the Galaxy S9 looks a lot like the Galaxy S8, with slim bezels at ... The Galaxy S9 has a 2960 x 1440 display,
which DisplayMate says is better ... stark with that "infinity display" stretching almost entirely across the front. ... the Google
Pixel 2 and iPhone X, which scored 98 and 97 respectively.. Galaxy Note 8 screen earns DisplayMate's first-ever A+ grade ... I
know many of you guys aren't happy that you aren't getting Android 10 on the S8/Note 8.. The Galaxy S9's Infinity Display gets
an "Excellent A+" rating; Galaxy S9's ... Display has been awarded the "Excellent A+" grade by the display ... from the previous-
gen Galaxy S8 and Galaxy S8+, DisplayMate notes that .... The iPhone X had "stolen" the crown from Samsung's own Galaxy
Note 8 last November. ... DisplayMate reviewed the phones' display, declaring it's the best display that ... foundation of both the
Galaxy S8 and Galaxy S8+ from the previous generation, as ... Altogether, Samsung calls this its "Infinity display.. Another
year, another Samsung Galaxy flagship. Which means another chance for DisplayMate to review the Galaxy S8's screen and
rank it among others in the .... DisplayMate has awarded its highest ever A+ grade to the Galaxy Note ... The Galaxy S8's Super
AMOLED Infinity Display reached close to 3K .... The Samsung Galaxy S8 had scored the highest ever score of A+ on tests ...
Galaxy Note 8 features a slightly larger Infinity Display than the Galaxy S8+. ... By rewarding the Galaxy Note 8's screen with
A+ grade, DisplayMate .... Samsung on Thursday announced that the latest Galaxy S9's Infinity Display has ... A+” grade by the
display evaluation experts over at DisplayMate Technologies. ... improved on various fronts over its predecessors – the Galaxy
S8 and S8+.. The results of DisplayMate Technologies' comprehensive evaluation of the Galaxy ... and has awarded the device
its highest-ever “Excellent A+” grade. Although the Galaxy S9's 3K Quad HD+ OLED Infinity Display features ... last year's
Galaxy S8, the new device matches or sets many smartphone display .... The Galaxy S8's Infinity Display: So Much More than
Meets the Eye · #Galaxy S8+ ... Galaxy Note10+ Receives DisplayMate's Highest-Ever A+ Grade. Galaxy .... DisplayMate
Technologies has released the results of its comprehensive evaluation of the Infinity Display found on the Galaxy S8,
concluding .... Given that DisplayMate has consistently crowned Samsung’s premium smartphones as the best in OLED class
every year, it’s hardly surprising to hear it do so again this time. ... The Samsung Galaxy S8’s Infinity Display, probably named
after infinity pools whose surface drops over the .... Note 9's Infinity Display earns highest-ever A+ grade in DisplayMate ...
exceeding the performance of both Galaxy S8 and Note 7 in the main .... The Infinity Display on Galaxy S8 also achieve native
color gamut with ... DisplayMate lists the following characteristics from the Galaxy S8's .... Galaxy S8 Infinity Display graded
by DisplayMate Another year another Samsung Galaxy flagship. Which means another chance for DisplayMate to review the ....
Samsung Galaxy S9 Infinity display awarded highest-ever A+ grade by ... According to DisplayMate technologies, the Galaxy
S9's Infinity Display is “the ... no different than the Infinity displays on the Galaxy S8 and Galaxy S8+.. It literally doesn't get
better than the Galaxy S8 screen, graded A+ by DisplayMate. DisplayMate's experts were left stunned by the Samsung .... The
Samsung Galaxy S8 comes with a 5.8-inch Infinity Display with ... Overall, DisplayMate has graded the Galaxy S8's display as
A+ while ... 87ec45a87b 
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